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SUPPLIER RESPONSE MANUAL- ONE ENVELOPE BID

This manual applies to the following methods of procurement:
(Competitive Negotiation 1, Direct-procurement 1, lease of Off-Space,
Open Tender 1, EOI, Restricted Tender 1, Request For Quotation 1)

1. A nofification email will come through to your official address as
captured in your registration details. See sample of screen shot below.

PUBLIC

New Bid Invitation RFX for ZADC Published from KRA
Created =1 COLOURPRINT LIMITED COLOURPRINT LIM

Dear Sir/Madam,

We are glad to invite you to participate in e-Bidding process with reference to Bid Invitation RFX for ZADC.

To Participate in e-bidding process you must follow below instructions:
1. Please click on below URL Link to log on to KRA e-Procurement system
a. https://suppliers.kra.go.ke
2. You must select the bid Invitation to submit your response
3. Fill the mandatory fields and attach necessary supporting documents
4. After successful response submission, please log-off
5. For detailed instructions please go through supplier e-bidding process user manual

Mote: e-Bidding process explained in detail at KRA User manual for e-Bidding.

Manuals-=e-Bidding->User Manual

Path to down load the user manual - https:/fwww.kra.go.ke/index.php/eprocurement/supplier -=Self Service User

&
BID5000002336

The email nofification will have an Bid as an attachment which should
downloaded to enable review of the information which includes RFx
number, Start date, Item, quantity etc. The nofification will also contain
a link to the Supplier Portal.

2. Loginto the Web Portal through the given link on the emaiil or
alternatively through the KRA Website under the E-procurement tab
Supplier Portal option. Use the given User ID and Password to log in fo
the portal.

In case you have forgotten your password email your request using
your registered email address and User ID (V humber) to
srmsupport@kra.go.ke
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User * v247|

Password *  eee.

3. Afterlogging in, click on the ‘RFx and Auctions’ tab.
Navigate to the “Show Quick Criteria Maintenance” tab and click on

the “Clear” and “Apply” buttons respectively to display the latest RFx's

that need responses.

Active Queries

4 Back Forward b History Favorites Personalize Wiew Help
Home RFx and Auctions Administration
overview Service Map

p RFx and Auctions > Overview > RFxand Auctions

eRFxs AI(88) Publshed (45) Ended (3} C 9}

eRFxs - All

eAuctions Al (2} Published (0% Ended (1) Completed (13

[~ Hide Quick Criteria

Event Number:

Event Status:
Creation Dats:
Deadline Date Flag
Status:

Response Time frame:

Smart Number;

1 Ewent Number

5 1445

| wiew: [[Standard View] ]|

To e}

Event Dsscription
K 1 07.02.2018 16:01.29

5000001365

K 01.02.2018 11:07

5000001339

000001337
5000001336

5000001335

5000001334
5000001332
5000001327

WVENKATESHH 2 29.01.2018 15:23
WEMIATESHH 29.01.2018 14:12
WVENKATESHH 2 25.01.2018 13:57
WENKATESHH 28.01.2018 10:51
VEMKATESHH 29.01.2018 10:29
VENKATESHH 25.01.2013 13:11
K 25.01.2018 10:33:02

1317
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T28588454 24.01.201

Event Type

Open Tender (1}
Open Tender (1}
Open Tender (2}
Open Tender (2}
Open Tender (2}
Open Tender (2}
Open Tender (2}
Open Tender (2}
Open Tender (2}
Open Tender (2}

4

nt Preview | Refresh Export 4
Event Status Start Date
Fublished 0Z/0TIZ018
Published 0242772019
Published 01/30/2019
Published 01/29/2019
Published 03/22/2018
Fublished 03/28/2018
Fublished 0272018
Published 0242772018
Published 01/25/2018
Published 01/24/2018
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End Date
02/07/2018
02/28/2019
01/31/2019
01/20/2019
03/23/2018
03/29/2018
037282018
02/28/2018
01/25/2018
01/25/2018

Response Numbsr

1900001805
1900001793

4. By clicking on the Event Number, the ‘Display RFx: ..." pop-up page is
loaded as shown:
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Display RFx: 5000002195
[ Print Preview || [%] | [ Close [[ Participate || Do Not Participate |[ Tentative || Questions and Answers (0 } |[ Export || System Information || Create Memory |

Number 5000002185 Smart Number T27521205 27.08.2018 14:57 Status Published Start Date End Date 08/31/2018 17:45:00 UTC+3 Remaining Time =
RFX Information tems | Motes and Attachments
RFx F s | Q i | Notes and Att;
: 00:00:00
Start Date: * Driginating Purchase Reguisition: (0010002760
. - o =
Submission Deadline: |08/31/2018 17:45:00 * Procurement Method: RES1
Opening Date: |08/31/2018 17:46:00

End of Binding Period:

Currency: |KES
Procurement Method Description: | Restricted Tender(1)

5. Click on the 'Items’ tab to view a summary of the requirements and
‘Notes and Aftachments’ to display and access the bid specifications
provided as well as any bidding instructions as highlighted above.

Display RFx: 5000002195
‘ | [ Participate ][ Do Mot Participate ][ Tentative ][ Questions and Answers (0 ) ][ System Information ][ Create Memory ]

Number 5000002195  SmartNumber T2752120527.082018 1457  Status Published  Start Date End Date 08/31/2015 17:45.00UTC+3  Remaining Time 3
AR ier— {—n ]
1 e l otes and Attachments |
RFx s | Questons | “mroream
: 00.:00:00
SEUILEE * Originating Purchase Requisition: 0010002760
. ) ) .
Submission Deadiine: |08/21/2018 17:45.00 - Procurement Methad =
Opening Date: | 08/31/2018 17:46:00

End of Binding Period:

Currency: |KES

Procurement Method Description: | Restricted Tender(1)

6. Download the Bid Document under ‘Description’ column as shown
below to enable you view the Bid Document.

Number 5000002195 Smart Number T2752120527.08.2018 14:57 Status Published Start Date End Date 08/31/2018 17:45:00 UTC+3 Remaining Time 2 Days 08:57:16

RFX Information /| tems . Motes and Attachments

Asgsigned To | Category Text Preview

| Add Attachment || Edit Description || Versiz | Delete |
Aszigned To Category Description File Hame Version Processar Checked Out
Document Header Standard Attachment [ Bid Document ] wm eula.pdf 1 O
P
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7. After viewing the Bid Document you will have the option to “Register”
or “Participate” / "Do Not Participate” / “Tentative” depending on the

Procurement Method.

Display RFx: 5000001445
Print Preview | | [ Cluse] Register [ Questions and Answers (0 ) ][ Export ][ System Information ][ Create Memory Snapshot ]

Smart Number K00009301 07.02.2018 16:01.29 Status Published Start Date 02/07/2018 16:37.00 UTC+3

Humber

Notes and Attachments

End Date

tems

RFX Information
RFx Parameters | Questions | Motes and Attachments

Start Date: |02/07/2018 16:37:00
an bate Procurement Method Description: | Open Tender (1)
o~ - - T
Submission Deadiine: |02/07/2018 18:00:00 & Frrarer iy i
Opening Date: |02/07/2018 18:05:00
End of Binding Period:
Currency; |KES

8. Click on the “Participate” button if you wish to respond to the RFx as
shown below.

Display RFx: 5000001445
Print Preview | | Close [ Participate ][ Do Not Participate ][ Tentative ][ Questions and Answers (0} ][ Export ][ System Information ][ Create Memory Snapsh ut]

“fou are registered to t x and will be informed of changes

Smart Number K00005301 07.02.2018 15:01:25% Status Published Start Date 02/07/2018 16:37:00 UTC+3 End Date 02/0

RFX Information tems ©° MNotes and Attachments
RFx F 3 | Q | Notes and Attachments
Start Date: (2072018 ESE 00 Procurement Method Description: | Open Tender (1)
* Submission Deadline: | 02/07/2018 18:00:00 * Procurement Method: OPEN
Opening Date: | 02/07/2018 18:05:00
End of Binding Period:
KES

Currency:

9. The “Create Response” button will become active as shown below

Display RFx: 5000001445
Print Preview | | | [ Close [ Do Not Participate ][

“fou hawve been registered. You will be informed of RFx

and Answers (0} ][ Export ][ System Information ][ Create Memory ]

|[ create Responze |[ 0

Jes

r K00009301 07.02.2018 16:01:25 Status Published Start Date 02/07/2018 16:37:00 UTC+3 End Date 02/07/2018 18

Number 5000001445

Notes and Attachments

ers Questions Motes and Attachments
Start Date: |(20772018 63700 Procurement Method Description: |Open Tender (1)
* Submission Deadline: |02/07/2018 18:00:00 - TrmrEr I T
Opening Date: |02/07/2018 18:05:00
End of Binding Period:
Currency: |KES

10. After clicking on the “Create Response” button, the ‘Create RFx
Response: ..." page will pop-up as shown below. This page will enable
you to input the price under the Items tab, attach pdf documents
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under the Notes and Attachments tab and respond to questions

provided under the questions tab.

/} ") KENYA REVENUE

Create RFx Response: 1900001854

| Submit | Read Only Print Preview | Check Close Save Delete Export Import Cuestions and Answers (0 ) System Information
0 Attribute If yes on the above what charges are applicable is mandatory; maintain attribute value

0 Attribute Will the system manage document posting? is mandatory; maintain attribute value

0 Attribute is it internationally recogized brand is mandatory; maintain attribute value

0 Attribute what are the nationalties of you in your company is mandatory; maintain attribute value
Response 1900001854 created

Number 1500001854 RFx Humber S000001445 Status Sawved Submission Deadline 02/07/2018 18:00:00 UTC+3

x Information |/ ltems |/ Motes and Attachments |/ Summary |/ Tracking
| Motes and Attachments | Payment

Event Pap@meters

Pricing Arrangement

Currency: Kenyan Shilling Pricing Arrangement:

Status and Statistics

11.In the ‘REx Information’ tab within the page, click on the ‘Questions’
marked as (1).

¢ The error messages point out the mandatory requirements that need to
be addressed before submission.

Create RFx Response: 1900001854

Submit \ Read Only  Print Preview \ Check Close Save Delete Export import Questions and Answers (0) Systeminformation Create Memory Snapshot

0 Attribute If yes on the above what charges are applicable is mandatory; maintain attribute value
D ttrivute Wil the system manage document posting? is mandatory; maintain attrioute value

0 Atribute is it internationally recogized brand is mandatory; maintain attribute value

D ttrivute what are the nationalties of you in your campany is mandatary; maintain attribute value

Humber 1900001854 RFx Number 5000001445 Status Saved Submission Deadline 02/07/2018 18:00:00 UTC+3 Opening Date 02/07/2018 18:05.00 UTC+3 Remaining Time 0 Days 01:18:37 RFx Owner |

RFx Information tems Notes and Attachments |/ Summary |/ Tracking |

SesicData | Questions | Nolesand Atiachments | Payment

Question

Reply Comment
* Willthe system manage document postng?: (%) Yes  O'No [wemanagd |
* If yes on the above what charges are applicable: [W\ fyes7|
* is it internationally recogized brand; (9 Yes O No (widely known |
* what are the nationalites of you in your company?: [kenyan | [kenyan ]

12. Still under the RFx information tab, click on the ‘Notes and
Attachments’ (1) tab then click on the ‘Add Attachment’ (2)
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Create RFx Response: 1900001854

Submit | Read Only  Print Preview | Check Close Save Delete Export Import Questions and Answers (0) System information Create Memory Snapshot

Number 1300001854 RFx Number 5000001445

Status Saved Submission Deadline 02/07/2018 18:00:00 UTC+3 Opening Date 02/07/2018 18:05:00 UTC+3 Remaining Time 0 Days 01:16:16

Conditions of Participation
|| RExtAuction Text

|| Bidder's Remarks “Emply-
:I Purchaser's Remarks -Empty-
|| ReiectionText Emply-

Add Attachment Edit Description  Versioning Delete Create Profile Fiter Settings

@ The table does not contain any data

13. Browse for your document from the files available on your machine

and upload the selected file.click on the ‘ok’ button to complete the
upload.

Add Attachment

Here you can upload an attachment. You have fo assign it fo either the document general data or fo anitem

Descripfion: | Bid Document
* Assign To: | General Data -

14. Still on the ‘Create RFx Response: ...’ page, click on the ‘lItems’ tab
then fill in the price per item

Create RFx. 1 54
‘ Submit | Read Only Piint Preview | Check Close Save Delele Export Import Questions and Answers (0) System Information Creste Memory Snapshot 9.‘
[ RFx response is complete and contains no enors
Number 1800001854 RFx Number 5000001445 Status Saved i 02072018 i 02072018 Remaining Time  00ays0100:04  RFxOwner Edwn Chacns  TotalValue  1,000,000.00 KES ‘
w:\mm- wrsznmzm-nsi mmwyi Traking
Detas Add New.s | Gopy Paste Delele | Galouate Vake Filtr Expand Al Colspse All Hide Outines and Informational Line \ﬁemssemrusl
[etntms [ oo [t i sty | i ] Pttty | it Gy Do | s oy | s oty | ot | roe | iy | romrer vy |t | e e | Fspsa |ttt [
[T~ cume s trining Outine 2008 ‘Confrence and Accomesation Services 1 1.000.000.00 KES From 03072018 1.000.000.00 (0 a0 1
D * @@ 0001AAE) Conferenced . S Service 000013 2008 ‘Confrence and Accomodation Services. 1 14 1,000,000.00| KES. 1 From 03/07/2018  1,000,000.00 00 o0 K
-® Wateral 0000 000 kEs, 1
-5 Materal 0.0 000 KES 1
A Vaterial 00 0.0 KES 1
- Materl 000 000 KES 1
o Wateral 000 000 KE§ 1
. m Vaterial 00 000 kES 1
000 000 KES 1
0.0 000 KES 1

/le\um | o000 | nsi
[rotaivaveotthenia [
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15. Click on the check button to ensure that you have no errors within the

document

/} ") KENYA REVENUE
h

se: 1900001854
| Submit| Resd Onby  Print Preview | Check Close Ssve Delete Export Import Questions and Answers {0} System Information  Creste Memony Snapshot

( # RFx response is complete and contains no emors )

Number 1500001854 RFx Number 5000001445 Status Saved Submi 02/07/2018 18:05

S 1 1

16. Click on the submit button to subbmit your bid

Create RFx Response: 1900001854
Resd Only Frint Freview | Check Close Save Delete Export Import Cuestions and Answers (D) System Information Creste Memony Snapshot

JFx response s complets and contsins no emors

ber 1300001854 RFx Number 5000001445 Status Saved Submission Deadline 02/07/2018 18:00:00 UTC+2 Opening Date 02/07/2018 18:05

S 1 1

e You will get the confirmation message as highlighted below

Display RFx Response: 1900001854

‘ _/) Edit | Drint Rraui L2 | oy Alithads Export Questions and Answers (0) Systeminformation Create Memory Snapshot

T T T T
[ RFx response 1300001854 submitted

Number 1300001854  RFxMNumber 5000001445  Status Saved Submission Deadline 02/07/2018 13:00:00 UTC+3  Opening Date 02/07/2018 18:05:00 UTC+3  Remaining Time 0 Days 01:00:04
" RFx Information }’ tems " Wotes and Attachments r/ Summary I/ Tracking |
w Notes
Add 4 Clea
Assigned To | Category Text Preview

1

17. Close all open pages then refresh your home page.
e Ensure that the event number you were working on has a response
number, and a response status of ‘submitted’ as highlighted below.

Active Queries

eRFxs AI(88) Published (45) Ended (9) Completed (9)
eAuctions Al (?) Publshed (0} Ended (1) Completed (1)

eRFxs - All

[v Hide Quick Criteria Maintznance |

Event Number: 3 ) To | =
Event Status: hd|
Creation Date: [ To 0 =

Deadiine Date Flag: -]
Status: ~]
Response Timeframe: -
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Smart Number: [

‘ View WH Cre Display Event Display Response | Print Previe Refresh Export 4
T/ Event Number Event Description Event Type Event Status Start Date End Date Response Number Response Status
L 5000001445 K00009301 07 022018 16:01:29 Open Tender (1) Published 02/07/2018 02/07/2018 1900001854 | | submitea

5000001385 K00009280 01 02 2018 11:07 Open Tender (1) Published 02/27/2018 02/28/2019 No Bid Created
i 5000001338 WENKATESHH 2 29.01.2018 15:22 Open Tender (2) Published 01/20/2019 0173172019 No Bid Created
| | soo0001337 WVENKATESHH 29.01.2018 14:12 Open Tender (2) Published 01/28/2019 01/30/2019 No Bid Created
| | 000001338 WENKATESHH 2 29.01.2018 13:57 Open Tender (2) Published 032212018 03/23/2018 No Bid Created
: 5000001335 VENKATESHH 29.01.2018 10:51 Open Tender (2) Published 03/28/2018 03/28/2018 No Bid Created
| | 000001334 VENKATESHH 29.01.2018 10:29 Open Tender (2) Published 03/27/2018 03/28/2018 No Bid Created
|| sonoo01332 VENKATESHH 25.01 2013 13:11 Open Tender (2) Published 02/27/2018 02/28/2018 No Bid Created
|| sooooo1zer K000D9250 25 01.2018 10:33:02 Open Tender (2) Published 01/25/2018 01/25/2018 1800001805 Saved
i 5000001317 T28588454 24.01 201 Open Tender (2) Published 01/24/2018 01/25/2018 1800001793 Submitted

N
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18. Log out from the portal when done.

END
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